
CITY OF SAN ANGELO
RFB ES-04-18 2018 Sealcoat Project

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 10,820 71.51$            773,738.20$      100.00$          1,081,956.46$       107.00$          1,157,693.42$  
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 476,061 3.30$               1,571,001.30$  3.75$               1,785,228.17$       3.15$               1,499,591.66$  
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 2,000 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0662 6110 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY Y EA 3,000 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
5 0666 6005 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 2,345 0.55$               1,289.75$          1.50$               3,517.50$               0.94$               2,204.30$          
6 0666 6027 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 8" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 1,189 1.20$               1,426.80$          3.00$               3,567.00$               1.87$               2,223.43$          
7 0666 6078 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W)(WORD 'ONLY')(120MIL) EA 6 400.00$          2,400.00$          500.00$          3,000.00$               391.39$          2,348.34$          
8 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 4,608 0.55$               2,534.40$          1.50$               6,912.00$               0.94$               4,331.52$          
9 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 23,578 0.55$               12,967.90$        1.10$               25,935.80$            0.88$               20,748.64$        

10 0666 6042 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 12" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 863 5.00$               4,315.00$          5.00$               4,315.00$               9.54$               8,233.02$          
11 0666 6048 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 24" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 1,328 10.00$            13,280.00$        7.00$               9,296.00$               14.61$            19,402.08$        
12 0666 6054 PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (ARROW) EA 12 250.00$          3,000.00$          400.00$          4,800.00$               325.24$          3,902.88$          
13 0666 6093 PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (RR XING) EA 10 500.00$          5,000.00$          700.00$          7,000.00$               810.34$          8,103.40$          
14 0672 6017 TRAFFIC BUTTON TY Y EA 2,600 3.50$               9,100.00$          4.00$               10,400.00$            4.58$               11,908.00$        
15 0672 6016 TRAFFIC BUTTON TY W EA 100 3.50$               350.00$              10.00$            1,000.00$               4.58$               458.00$              
16 0672 6007 REFL PAV MRKR TY I-C EA 50 3.50$               175.00$              10.00$            500.00$                  6.34$               317.00$              
17 0672 6013 REFL PAV MRKR TY II-A-A EA 2,000 3.50$               7,000.00$          5.00$               10,000.00$            6.34$               12,680.00$        
18 - TOWING EA 10 250.00$          2,500.00$          2,000.00$       20,000.00$            150.00$          1,500.00$          
19 0500  6001 MOBILIZATION(10%) LS 1 575,000.00$  575,000.00$      317,500.00$  317,500.00$          140,000.00$  140,000.00$      
20 0502 6025 BARRICADES, SIGNS, AND TRAFFIC HANDLING MO 3 2,000.00$       6,000.00$          7,500.00$       22,500.00$            7,500.00$       22,500.00$        
21 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 266,400.00$  266,400.00$      266,400.00$  266,400.00$          266,400.00$  266,400.00$      

3,257,478.35$  3,583,827.93$       3,184,545.68$  

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 2,334 71.51$            166,904.34$      No Bid 110.00$          256,764.00$      
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 102,706 3.30$               338,929.80$      No Bid 3.30$               338,928.48$      
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 435 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0662 6110 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY Y EA 150 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
5 0666 6005 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 1,715 0.55$               943.25$              No Bid 2.52$               4,321.80$          
6 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 4,385 0.55$               2,411.75$          No Bid 2.52$               11,050.20$        
7 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 1,540 0.55$               847.00$              No Bid 2.42$               3,726.80$          
8 0666 6027 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 8" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 270 1.20$               324.00$              No Bid 6.93$               1,871.10$          
9 0666 6042 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 12" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 154 5.00$               770.00$              No Bid 11.03$            1,698.62$          

10 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 51,600.00$    51,600.00$        51,600.00$    51,600.00$            51,600.00$    51,600.00$        
562,730.14$      No Bid 669,961.00$      

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 3,570 71.51$            255,290.70$      No Bid 110.00$          392,743.00$      
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 157,097 3.30$               518,420.10$      No Bid 3.30$               518,420.10$      
3 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 78,000.00$    78,000.00$        78,000.00$    78,000.00$            78,000.00$    78,000.00$        

851,710.80$      No Bid 989,163.10$      

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 386 71.51$            27,602.86$        No Bid 110.00$          42,429.00$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 16,972 3.30$               56,007.60$        No Bid 3.30$               56,006.28$        
3 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 8,500.00$       8,500.00$          8,500.00$       8,500.00$               8,500.00$       8,500.00$          

92,110.46$        No Bid 106,935.28$      

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 25 71.51$            1,787.75$          No Bid 425.00$          10,740.91$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 1,112 3.30$               3,669.60$          No Bid 10.00$            11,120.00$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 62 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6006 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 2,465 0.55$               1,355.75$          No Bid 3.36$               8,282.40$          
5 - PREFAB PAV MRKR TY C (W) (HANDICAP) EA 6 500.00$          3,000.00$          No Bid 315.00$          1,890.00$          
6 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 1,000.00$       1,000.00$          1,000.00$       1,000.00$               1,000.00$       1,000.00$          

10,813.10$        No Bid 33,033.31$        

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 48 71.51$            3,432.48$          No Bid 425.00$          20,318.86$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 2,104 3.30$               6,943.20$          No Bid 10.00$            21,036.00$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 67 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6006 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 2,697 0.55$               1,483.35$          No Bid 3.62$               9,763.14$          
5 - PREFAB PAV MRKR (HANDICAP) EA 8 500.00$          4,000.00$          No Bid 315.00$          2,520.00$          
6 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 1,600.00$       1,600.00$          1,600.00$       1,600.00$               1,600.00$       1,600.00$          

17,459.03$        No Bid 55,238.00$        

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 263 71.51$            18,807.13$        No Bid 175.00$          46,087.05$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 11,588 3.30$               38,240.40$        No Bid 4.50$               52,144.20$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 360 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6006 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 13,961 0.55$               7,678.55$          No Bid 2.65$               36,996.65$        
5 - REFL PAV MRK TY I (R) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 1,551 0.55$               853.05$              No Bid 0.80$               1,240.80$          
6 0666 6042 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 12" (SLD) (120 MIL) LF 108 5.00$               540.00$              No Bid 2.65$               286.20$              
7 - PREFAB PAV MRKR (HANDICAP) EA 18 500.00$          9,000.00$          No Bid 300.00$          5,400.00$          
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Alternate B3
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Alternate A3
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8 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 7,500.00$       7,500.00$          7,500.00$       7,500.00$               7,500.00$       7,500.00$          
82,619.13$        No Bid 149,654.90$      

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 10 71.51$            715.10$              No Bid 950.00$          9,482.73$          
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 439 3.30$               1,448.70$          No Bid 25.00$            10,980.00$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 40 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6042 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 12" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 22 5.00$               110.00$              No Bid 11.55$            254.10$              
5 0666 6006 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 586 0.55$               322.30$              No Bid 11.55$            6,768.30$          
6 - PREFAB PAV MRKR (HANDICAP) EA 2 500.00$          1,000.00$          No Bid 315.00$          630.00$              
7 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 400.00$          400.00$              400.00$          400.00$                  400.00$          400.00$              

3,996.10$          No Bid 28,515.13$        

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 82 71.51$            5,863.82$          No Bid 250.00$          20,622.73$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 3,630 3.30$               11,979.00$        No Bid 5.50$               19,962.80$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 303 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6006 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 5,445 0.55$               2,994.75$          No Bid 3.05$               16,607.25$        
5 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 2,100.00$       2,100.00$          2,100.00$       2,100.00$               2,100.00$       2,100.00$          

22,937.57$        No Bid 59,292.78$        

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 125 71.51$            8,938.75$          No Bid 195.00$          24,314.73$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 5,486 3.30$               18,103.80$        No Bid 4.25$               23,317.20$        
3 0662 6110 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY Y EA 84 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 3,340 0.55$               1,837.00$          No Bid 2.42$               8,082.80$          
5 0310 6004 PRIME COAT (AC) GAL 4,801 4.50$               21,604.50$        No Bid 5.25$               25,203.15$        
6 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 5,300.00$       5,300.00$          5,300.00$       5,300.00$               5,300.00$       5,300.00$          

55,784.05$        No Bid 86,217.88$        

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 262 71.51$            18,735.62$        No Bid 175.00$          45,810.23$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 11,518 3.30$               38,009.40$        No Bid 4.00$               46,072.00$        
3 0666 6123 PRIME COAT (AC) GAL 10,078 4.50$               45,351.00$        No Bid 4.00$               40,313.00$        
4 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 10,800.00$    10,800.00$        10,800.00$    10,800.00$            10,800.00$    10,800.00$        

112,896.02$      No Bid 142,995.23$      

Item No Desc Code Item Description Units Est Qty Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost Unit Price Final Cost
1 0316 6126 AGGR(TY-PB GR-4 SAC-A) or SAC-B (Circle one) CY 510 71.51$            36,470.10$        No Bid 112.00$          57,149.53$        
2 0316 6048 ASPH (AC-20-5TR) GAL 22,452 3.30$               74,091.60$        No Bid 3.35$               75,212.86$        
3 0662 6109 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY W EA 1,500 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
4 0662 6110 WK ZN PAV MRK SHT TERM (TAB) TY Y EA 2,000 SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY SUBSIDIARY
5 0666 6005 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 553 0.55$               304.15$              No Bid 3.15$               1,741.95$          
6 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (BRK) (120MIL) LF 26 0.55$               14.30$                No Bid 3.15$               81.90$                
7 0666 6123 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 18,850 0.55$               10,367.50$        No Bid 0.89$               16,776.50$        
8 0666 6042 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 12" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 138 5.00$               690.00$              No Bid 6.30$               869.40$              
9 0666 6048 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 24" (SLD) (120MIL) LF 230 10.00$            2,300.00$          No Bid 10.50$            2,415.00$          

10 0666 6054 PREFAB PAV MRK TY C (W) (ARROW) EA 6 250.00$          1,500.00$          No Bid 367.50$          2,205.00$          
11 0672 6007 REFL PAV MRKR TY I-C EA 200 3.50$               700.00$              No Bid 5.25$               1,050.00$          
12 0672 6013 REFL PAV MRKR TY II-A-A EA 350 3.50$               1,225.00$          No Bid 5.25$               1,837.50$          
13 0666 6093 PREFAB PAV MARK TY C (W) (RR XING) EA 8 500.00$          4,000.00$          No Bid 367.50$          2,940.00$          
14 - CONTINGENCY(10%) LS 1 12,600.00$    12,600.00$        12,600.00$    12,600.00$            12,600.00$    12,600.00$        

144,262.65$      No Bid 174,879.64$      

5,214,797.40$  3,583,827.93$       5,680,431.92$  
Note:  Should there be any differences between the unit price and 

the extended pricing calculations, the unit price will prevail.
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