CITY OF SAN ANGELO
BID TABULATION * RFB NO: VM-06-15 * November 10, 2015

Petroleum Traders Pinnacle Petroleum Sun Coast Resources Martin Eagle Mansfield Oil || Regal Oil Schneider Dist. Fuel Source/ Kendrick Oil Company Ways Company
DIESEL TANKWAGON (APPROX 15,000 GALLONS)
Diesel, Red Dye | | |
Additional Additional Additional Additional Additional
Refinery/Terminal Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost| Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts
% Days Days % Days % Days % Days % Days
San Angelo 0.175 (250-1000 gallons)
$0.2500 0% 30 30 $0.3802 30 $0.0583 $0.1100 30 0.10 (1001-4500 gallons)
Big Sering £0.-2500 o o NO BID NO BID NO BID
Abilene $0.2500 0 30 0.3802 30
[ — —
UNLEADED GASOLINE TANKWAGON (APPROX 24,000 GALLONS) | | |
Unleaded Gasoline, 87 Octane minimum [ | |
Additional Additional Additional Additional Additional
Refinery/Terminal Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost| Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts
% Days Days % Days % Days % Days % Days % Days
San Angelo
0.18 (250-1000 gallons;
$0.2500 0% 30 30 RO MLl $0.3153 30 $0.0390 $0.1100 30 0.105( (1001-45090 gallo)ns) NOEL
Abilene $0.2500 0 30 0.3153 30
DIESEL TRANSPORT (APPROX 300,000 GALLONS) | | |
Diesel, Red Dye [ | |
Additional Additional Additional Additional Additional
Refinery/Terminal Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost| Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts
% Days Days Days % Days % Days % Days % Days % Days
San Angelo $0.0312 0% 30 30 30 $ 0.2524 10 Net $ 0.0313 30 $ 0.0583 $ 0.0400 $0.0453 $ 0.0400 10
Odessa 30 $ 0.3500 10
Big Spring $0.0733 0 30 30 $ 0.3000 10 0.0891 0.09 10
Abilene $0.0774 0 30 30 $ 0.0782 30 0.095 10
Tye 0.0852 0.09 10
R —
UNLEADED GASOLINE TRANSPORT (APPROX 500,000 GALLONS) [ | |
Unleaded gasoline, 87 octane minimum | | |
Additional Additional Additional Additional Additional
REFINERY/TERMINAL Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost| Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Cost Terms/Discounts Additional Cost Terms/Discounts Cost Terms/Discounts
% Days Days Days % Days % Days % Days % Days % Days
San Angelo $0.02820 0% 30 30 3011 $ 0.2524 10 Net $ 0.0346 30]] $ 0.0390 $ 0.0400 $ 0.0473 $ 0.0400 10
Odessa 30 $ 0.3500 10
Big Spring $0.0667 0 30 30 $ 0.3000 10 0.0843 0.09 10
Abilene $0.0658 0 30 30 0.0879 30 0.095 10
Tye 0.0809 0.09 10
k., )y — 0y Ty """
Piggy Back Availibility:
P-Cards accepted (Y/N): Y N Y N N N N Y N N
Payment Discount: Addtl 4.5% N With Fee N N N With 3% Fee N N
Co-operative Purchasing: (Y/N) Y Y Y N N Y Y N Y Y
Local to Non Resident Percentage
/Local Award Option No
Bids Mailed to:
Schneider Distributing Company San Angelo X
Petroleum Traders Fort Wayne IN
T&C Wholesale Mertzon X
Ways Company Bronte TX
SC Fuels Orange CA
Regal Oil San Angelo X
Fuel Source Mertzon X
Air Liquide Industrial U.S.LP Grand Prairie X
Delek Refining & Marketing Bronte X
Johnson Oil Company Abilene X No Bid
Mansfield Oil Gainesville GA
Valero San Antonio X
Rambler Contractor Service LLC Millsap X
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