
Y:\15-RFX\Vehicle Maint\VM1015 Half ton truck 10-29-15\VM1015 Bid Tabulation Revised

C I T Y   O F   S A N   A N G E L O 
BID TABULATION * RFB NO: VM-10-15/Half Ton Pickups * October 29, 2015

Item Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1/2 Ton Regular Cab - Make and Model

Delivery Lead Time

1/2 Ton Regular Cab EA 1  $    20,965.00  $                20,965.00  $    21,915.00  $                 21,915.00 

4.53%
YES-Bid Under 5%

No. Options Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1 Parts, Service, and Operators Manuals EA 1  NC  NC             225.00                         225.00 

2 Delivery EA 1  NC  NC  NC  NC 

3 Extended Warranty EA 1          1,375.00                      1,375.00 
 1440(2wd) / 
1565(4wd)                      1,565.00 

4 Power Door Locks 1  NC  NC 

5 Power Windows EA 1

6 Power Mirrors 1

7 Steering Wheel Tilt 1  NC  NC  NC  NC 

8 Cruise Control 1  NC  NC             192.00                         192.00 

9 Cloth Seats; 40/Console/40 Type Seating 1  NC  NC  NA  NA 

10 Four Wheel Drive 1          2,890.00                      2,890.00          4,310.00                      4,310.00 

11 Hands Free Bluetooth Package Ea 1 260.00            260.00                        358.00           358.00                        

Piggy Back Availibility: No Yes
Payment Discount: None None

Bids Mailed To:
All American Chevrolet San Angelo. TX
Hill Country Ford Goldthwaite, TX
Jim Bass Ford San Angelo, TX
Mitchell Buick - GMC San Angelo, TX NO BID
Mitchell Buick - Toyota San Angelo, TX NO BID
Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX
Stanley Chrysler Dodge Jeep Brownwood, TX

            725.00                         725.00 

Local Award Option

Days

Local to Non Resident Percentage Difference in vehicle base price

            827.00 

90-120 Days

2016 Chevrolet 1500 Silvarado 4x2 
Reg Cab LUB CC15903 Ford F150

90-115 Days

CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVY 
PONTIAC JIM BASS FORD, INC.

                        827.00 



C I T Y   O F   S A N   A N G E L O 
BID TABULATION * RFB NO: VM-10-15/Half Ton Pickups * October 29, 2015

Item Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1/2 Ton Extended Cab - Make and Model

Delivery Lead Time

1/2 Ton Extended Cab EA 6  $    22,185.00           133,110.00  $    22,805.00  $          136,830.00 

2.79%

YES-Bid Under 5%

No. Options Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1 Parts, Service, and Operators Manuals EA 1  N/C  N/C             225.00                     225.00 

2 Delivery EA 1  N/C  N/C  NC  NC 

3 Extended Warranty EA 1          1,375.00               1,375.00 
 1440(2wd) / 
1565(4wd)                  1,565.00 

4 Power Door Locks EA 1  Incl.  Incl. 

5 Power Windows EA 1  Incl.  Incl. 

6 Power Mirrors EA 1             360.00                  360.00 

7 Steering Wheel Tilt EA 1  Incl.  Incl.  NC  NC 

8 Cruise Control EA 1  Incl.  Incl.             192.00                     192.00 

9 Four Wheel Drive EA 1          2,940.00               2,940.00          3,177.00                  3,177.00 

10 8' Bed EA 1  Not Available  Not Available          1,030.00                  1,030.00 

11 Cloth Seats; 40/Console/40 Type Seating EA 1  N/C  N/C             252.00                     252.00 

12 Hands Free Bluetooth Package EA 1             260.00                  260.00             358.00                     358.00 

13 Special Police/Response Pkg Ea 1 Not Available Not Available 44.00                                   44.00 

14 Factory Installed Tailer Brake Controller Ea 1 230.00            230.00                 234.00                               234.00 

Piggy Back Availibility: No Yes
Payment Discount: None None

Bids Mailed To:
All American Chevrolet San Angelo. TX
Hill Country Ford Goldthwaite, TX
Jim Bass Ford San Angelo, TX
Mitchell Buick - GMC San Angelo, TX NO BID
Mitchell Buick - Toyota San Angelo, TX NO BID
Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX
Stanley Chrysler Dodge Jeep Brownwood, TX

2016 Chevrolet 1500 Silverado 
4x2 Double Cab cc15753 FORD F-150

CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVY 
PONTIAC JIM BASS FORD, INC.

Days 90-120 Days 90-115 Days

            998.00                     998.00 

Local Award Option

Local to Non Resident Percentage Difference in vehicle base price



C I T Y   O F   S A N   A N G E L O 
BID TABULATION * RFB NO: VM-10-15/Half Ton Pickups * October 29, 2015

Item Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1/2 Ton Crew Cab - Make and Model

Delivery Lead Time

1/2 Ton Crew Cab EA 1  $    24,995.00  $          24,995.00  $    24,953.00  $          24,953.00 

NA

NA

No. Options Unit Est Qty Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price

1 Parts, Service, and Operators Manuals EA 1  NC  NC             225.00                   225.00 

2 Delivery EA 1  NC  NC  NC  NC 

3 Extended Warranty EA 1  $      1,375.00  $            1,375.00 
 1440(2wd) / 
1565(4wd)                1,565.00 

4 Power Door Locks EA 1  NC  NC 

5 Power Windows EA 1  NC  NC 

6 Power Mirrors EA 1  $         360.00  $               360.00 

7 Steering Wheel Tilt EA 1  NC  NC  NC  NC 

8 Cruise Control EA 1  NC  NC             192.00                   192.00 

9 Four Wheel Drive EA 1  $      2,475.00  $            2,475.00          4,286.00                4,286.00 

10 6.5" Bed EA 1  $         360.00  $               360.00          1,030.00                1,030.00 

11 Cloth Seats; 40/Console/40 Type Seating EA 1  NC  NC             252.00                   252.00 

12 Hands Free Bluetooth Package EA 1  $         260.00  $               260.00             358.00                   358.00 

13 Special Police/Response Pkg Ea 1 620.00$           $               620.00 44.00             44.00                   

14 Factory Installed Tailer Brake Controller Ea 1 230.00$          230.00$               234.00           234.00                 

Piggy Back Availibility: No Yes
Payment Discount: None None

Bids Mailed To:
All American Chevrolet San Angelo. TX
Hill Country Ford Goldthwaite, TX
Jim Bass Ford San Angelo, TX
Mitchell Buick - GMC San Angelo, TX NO BID
Mitchell Buick - Toyota San Angelo, TX NO BID
Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX
Stanley Chrysler Dodge Jeep Brownwood, TX

Days 90-120 Days 90-115 Days

2016 Chevrolet 1500 Silvarado 
4x2 Crew Cab cc15543 FORD F-150

CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVY 
PONTIAC JIM BASS FORD, INC.

            998.00                   998.00 

Local to Non Resident Percentage Difference in vehicle base price

Local Award Option
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	Ext Cab
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