
Lowest Cost Per Group

 Premade signs Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1
Stop sign R1-1, 30”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 500 23.68$      11,840.00$   22.50$      11,250.00$   25.39$      12,695.00$      28.11$      14,055.00$      21.85$      10,925.00$      

2
Stop sign R1-1 36”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 33.04$      6,608.00$     32.40$      6,480.00$     38.49$      7,698.00$        40.79$      8,158.00$        31.39$      6,278.00$        

3
Yield sign R1-2, 36”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 500 18.02$      9,010.00$     17.55$      8,775.00$     19.89$      9,945.00$        19.98$      9,990.00$        16.14$      8,070.00$        

4
Do Not Enter R5-1 30”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 23.68$      4,736.00$     24.38$      4,876.00$     25.69$      5,138.00$        28.81$      5,762.00$        22.26$      4,452.00$        

5
School Crosswalk S1-1 36”, High 
Intensity Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 33.04$      6,608.00$     35.10$      7,020.00$     39.49$      7,898.00$        41.49$      8,298.00$        30.84$      6,168.00$        

6

Object Marker OM-3R 12”X36”, High 
Intensity Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA

200
13.17        2,634.00$     11.70$      2,340.00$     13.14        2,628.00$        13.83        2,766.00$        10.68        2,136.00$        

7

Object Marker OM-3L 12”X36”, High 
Intensity Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA

200
13.17$      2,634.00$     11.70$      2,340.00$     13.14$      2,628.00$        13.83$      2,766.00$        10.68$      2,136.00$        

8
Stop Ahead W3-1 30”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 25.25$      5,050.00$     24.38$      4,876.00$     29.99$      5,998.00$        33.81$      6,762.00$        22.89$      4,578.00$        

9
Arrow W16-7p 24”X12”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 9.95$        1,990.00$     7.80$        1,560.00$     8.99$        1,798.00$        9.22$        1,844.00$        7.52$        1,504.00$        

10
Ahead W16-9p 12”X12”, High Intensity 
Prismatic sheeting (HIP) EA 200 9.95          1,990.00$     3.90          780.00$        8.99          1,798.00$        4.61          922.00$           7.52          1,504.00$        

Subtotal 53,100.00     50,297.00     58,224.00        61,323.00        47,751.00        

Sign Blanks with white HIP reflective 
sheeting no border

Unit Est. 
Qty

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

11 42” X 9”, with white HIP one side EA 200 11.16        2,232.00$     9.30          1,860.00$     10.99        2,198.00$        10.68        2,136.00$        9.61$        1,922.00$        
12 36” X 9”, with white HIP one side EA 1200 9.96          11,952.00$   7.99          9,588.00$     9.49          11,388.00$      9.16          10,992.00$      8.28$        9,936.00$        
13 30” X 9”, with white HIP one side EA 1200 8.71          10,452.00$   6.66          7,992.00$     7.99          9,588.00$        7.63          9,156.00$        6.93$        8,316.00$        
14 24” X 24”, with white HIP one side EA 100 15.84        1,584.00$     14.20        1,420.00$     15.96        1,596.00$        16.28        1,628.00$        13.96$      1,396.00$        
15 30” X 30”, with white HIP one side EA 100 23.35        2,335.00$     22.19        2,219.00$     24.99        2,499.00$        25.44        2,544.00$        21.81$      2,181.00$        
16 18” X  24”, with white HIP one side EA 100 12.48        1,248.00$     10.65        1,065.00$     11.99        1,199.00$        12.21        1,221.00$        10.47$      1,047.00$        
17 12” X 18”, with white HIP one side EA 100 7.60          760.00$        5.33          533.00$        5.99          599.00$           6.11          611.00$           5.57$        557.00$           
18 24” X 30”, with white HIP one side EA 100 19.16        1,916.00$     17.75        1,775.00$     19.99        1,999.00$        20.35        2,035.00$        17.45$      1,745.00$        
19 18” X 18”, with white HIP one side EA 100 9.99          999.00$        7.99          799.00$        8.99          899.00$           9.16          916.00$           8.22$        822.00$           
20 12” X 24”, with white HIP one side EA 100 9.12          912.00$        7.10          710.00$        7.99          799.00$           8.14          814.00$           7.36$        736.00$           

Subtotal 34,390.00     27,961.00     32,764.00        32,053.00        28,658.00        

Sign Blanks with yellow HIP 
reflective sheeting no border

0 Est. 
Qty

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit Price Extended 
Price

21 30” X 30”, with yellow HIP one side EA 200 23.35        4,670.00$     22.19        4,438.00$     24.99        4,998.00$        25.44        5,088.00$        21.81        4,362.00$        
22 18” X 18”, with yellow HIP one side EA 100 9.99          999.00$        7.99          799.00$        8.99          899.00$           9.16          916.00$           8.22          822.00$           
23 12” X 24”, with yellow HIP one side EA 100 9.12          912.00$        7.10          710.00$        7.99          799.00$           8.14          814.00$           7.36          736.00$           

Subtotal 6,581.00       5,947.00       6,696.00          6,818.00          5,920.00          

Sign posts, wedges, and clamps
EA Est. 

Qty
Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit Price Extended 

Price
24  2 3/8” OD X 13’ GALV. Post 13GA. EA 2400 NO BID NO BID 19.89        47,736.00$      NO BID 25.78        61,872.00$      
25 2 3/8” OD Poz Loc Socket EA 2400 NO BID NO BID 7.99          19,176.00$      NO BID 12.06        28,944.00$      
26 2 3/8” OD Wedge for 27” Socket EA 2400 NO BID NO BID 3.29          7,896.00$        NO BID 3.00          7,200.00$        
27 2 3/8” OD Clamps EA 4800 NO BID NO BID 1.34          6,432.00$        NO BID 1.35          6,480.00$        

Subtotal -                -                81,240.00        -                  104,496.00      
Total Bid 94,071.00$   84,205.00$   178,924.00$    100,194.00$    186,825.00$    

Markup___/D  

ND / No 5% Ohio TX 5% Ohio 5% Alabama
14-21 30 28 30-45 30

Piggy Back Option: N Y N N Y
Payment Terms: N30 N30 N30 N30/0 N30

Accept P-Card: Y Disc? __N__ Y Disc? __N__ Y Disc? __N__ Y Disc? __N__ Y Disc? _--__

** Alternate Prices given
Bid Invitations sent to: ***Minimum order for Posts
Pathmark Traffic Products
Centerline Supply
Hall Signs
Lyle Signs
Airgas Southwest
SafeLane Traffic Supply
Vulcan Signs

C I T Y   O F   S A N   A N G E L O 
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No No

Extended 
Price

Extended 
Price

0%
Markup___/Discount___ 

No

Extended 
Price

0%
Markup___/Discount___ 

No

Reciprocity:

San Marcos, TX
San Antonio, TX

Member of Buyboard or other Purchasing Co-op?

Calendar Days for Delivery:

No

Bloomington, IN
Jamestown, ND
San Angelo, TX
Wimberley, TX

Foley, AL

Vulcan**

Extended 
Price

0%
Markup___/Discount___ 

Est. 
Qty

Newman

Extended 
Price

Osburn Pathmark

Markup or Discount on products not listed 0%
Markup___/Discount___ 

0%
Markup___/Discount___ 

Rocal
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