CITY OF SAN ANGELO

BID TABULATION * RFB NO: WU-06-15/ 2015 Industrial Electrical* May 22, 2015 2PM

Vendor: Bunyard Hasty Electric Inc.

Vendor: Mike Verfurth Electric

A. Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

A. Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

Hourly Rate Weekends & Average Hourly Rate Weekends & Average
Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Holidays Bidder's price/Hr 1 Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Holidays Bidder's price/Hr 1
Licensed Licensed Licensed Minimum Charge | Parts Mark- [Journeyman & 1 Licensed Licensed Licensed Minimum Charge | Parts Mark- | Journeyman & 1
Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice |Journeyman| Apprentice | $'s and/or Hours up % Helper Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice | $'s and/or Hours up % Helper
S 60.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 60.00 | S 90.00 | $ 60.00 3 35% 75 S 69.50 | $ 57.50 | $ 105.00 | $ 86.25 | S 139.00 [ $ 115.00 | $ 69.50 20%| S 127.00
B. Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up B. Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up
. Bidder's . . Bidder's .
Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Weekends & - Parts Mark- | Technician & 1 Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Weekends & - Parts Mark- | Technician & 1
(Technician) (Technician) Holidays (Technician) Minimum Charge up % Helper (Technician) (Technician) Holidays (Technician) Minimum Charge up % Helper
4 $'s and/or Hours p P 4 $'s and/or Hours p P
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 79.50 | $ 11925 [ 3 159.00 | $ 79.50 25%| $ 137.00
C. Electricians C. Electricians
Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 2 Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 2
Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company 3 Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company
Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company 5 Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company 0

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING: Should other Governmental Entities decide to participate in this contract, would you, the

Vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, specifications and pricing would apply?

Please Check Y/N:
PAYMENT VIA CITY P-CARD ?

Yes
Yes

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING: Should other Governmental Entities decide to participate in this contract, would you, the

Vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, specifications and pricing would apply?

Please Check Y/N:
PAYMENT VIA CITY P-CARD ?

Yes
Yes

Vendor: Patriot Automation & Control LLC

Vendor: INDECO Industial Electric **Bid turned in 5/26/15 - ineligible for consideration

A. Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

A. Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Holidays Average Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Holidays Average
Bidder's price/Hr 1 Bidder's price/Hr 1
Licensed Licensed Licensed Minimum Charge | Parts Mark- |Journeyman & 1| Licensed Licensed Licensed Minimum Charge | Parts Mark- [ Journeyman & 1
Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice |Journeyman| Apprentice | $'s and/or Hours up % Helper Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice | Journeyman | Apprentice | $'s and/or Hours up % Helper
S 55.00 | $ 32.00|$ 8250 | $ 48.00 | $ 8250 | $ 48.00 3 $ 87.00 Ineligible to Open/ Bid delivered 5/26/15
*Plus Truck,
Trailer, tools, etc.
B. Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up B. Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up
Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Weekends & . .Bidder's Parts Mark- | Technician & 1 Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Weekends & . .Bidder's Parts Mark- | Technician & 1
(Technician) (Technician) Holidays (Technician) Minimum Charge up % Helper (Technician) (Technician) Holidays (Technician) Minimum Charge up % Helper
$'s and/or Hour: $'s and/or Hour:
S 105.00 S 157.50 S 82.50 3 %| S 137.00 Ineligible to Open/ Bid delivered 5/26/15
*PIUs Truck,
Trailer, tools, etc.
C. Electricians C. Electricians
Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 3 Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 0
Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company 8 Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company 0
Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company 48 Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING: Should other Governmental Entities decide to participate in this contract, would you, the

Vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, specifications and pricing would apply?

Please Check Y/N:

PAYMENT VIA CITY P-CARD ?

No

No

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING: Should other Governmental Entities decide to participate in this contract, would you, the

Vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, specifications and pricing would apply?

Please Check Y/N:

PAYMENT VIA CITY P-CARD ?

NA

NA




Requests for Bids were sent to:

Bryant Electric Co San Angelo TX
Bunyard Hasty Elect Inc  |San Angelo TX
Electrical By Deb San Angelo TX
Five Star Electric Miles TX
Indeco Industrial Electric |San Angelo TX
Jett Electric San Angelo TX
Mike Verfurth Electric San Angelo TX
Patriot Automation and CqSan Angelo TX
RM Electrical San Angelo TX
Three Rivers Electric Co. |San Angelo TX
Automation & Control Inc]San Angelo X
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